oroiNanceno. 03

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SANCTUARY, TEXAS, AMENDING VARIOUS PROVISIONS OF CHAPTER 5, “FIRE
PREVENTION AND PROTECTION” TO ADOPT THE 2021 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE AS THE OFFICIAL
MUNICIPAL FIRE CODE OF THE CITY; PROVIDING FOR RECORDING OF THE CODES AS A PUBLIC RECORD
PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES: PROVIDING THAT THIS ORDINANCE
SHALL BE CUMULATIVE OF ALL ORDINANCES, PROVIDING A SEVERABILTY CLAUSE, PROVIDING A PENALTY
FOR VIOLATIONS HEREOF, PROVIDING A SAVINGS CLAUSE, PROVIDING FOR PUBLICATION IN THE OFFICIAL
NEWSPAPER, AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, the City of Sanctuary is a Type A City adopting the electorate pursuant to Article XI, Section 5 of the
State of Texas Constitution and Chapter 9 of the Local Government Code, and

WHEREAS, the City of Sanctuary desires to include any amendments of the various provisions of Chapter 5,
“Fire Prevention & Protection” and to adopt the 2021 International Fire Code with Local amendments, as the
official fire code of the City.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SANCTUARY, TEXAS:

SECTION 1.

Article 5.05 “Fire Code” of Chapter 5 “Fire Prevention & Protection” of the Code of Ordinances, City of Sanctuary,
Texas, is hereby amended to read as follows:

“Section 5.05.001 / Adopted

The 2021 Edition of the International Fire Code is hereby adopted as the official fire code of the City of Sanctuary,
Texas, and is fully incorporated by reference as though copied into this section in its entirety. The material
contained in such code shall not be included in the formal municipal codification of ordinances but shall be
maintained as a public record in the office the city secretary and will be available for public inspection and
copying during regular business hours.”

SECTION II.

Article 5.05.004 “Local Amendments” of Chapter 5 “Fire Prevention & Protection” of the Code of Ordinances,
City of Sanctuary is hereby amended to read as follows:

“Section 5.05.004 Local Amendments to the 2021 International Fire Code.

The 2021 Edition of the International Fire Code, as adopted herein, is hereby amended by adoption of those
local amendments shown on Exhibit “A” attached hereto.”

SECTION Iil.

This ordinance shall be cumulative of all provisions of ordinances and on the Code of the City of Sanctuary,
Texas, as amended, except where the provisions are in direct conflict with the provisions of other ordinances, in
which event the conflicting provisions of the other ordinances are hereby repealed.

SECTION IV.

It is hereby declared to be the intention of the City Council that the phrases, clauses, sentences, paragraphs
and sections of this ordinance are severable, and if any phrase, clause, sentence, paragraph or section of this
ordinance shall be declared unconstitutional by the valid judgment or degree of any court of competent



AT

jurisdiction, such unconstitutionality shall not affect any of the remaining phrases, clauses, sentences, and
sections of this ordinance, since the same would have been enacted by the City Council without incorporation
in this ordinance of any such unconstitutional phrase, clause, sentence, paragraph, or section.

SECTION V.

Any person, firm or corporation who violates, disobeys, omits, neglects, refuses or fails to comply with, or who
resists the enforcement of any provision of this ordinance shall be fined not more than Two Thousand Dollars
($2,000.00) for each offense. Each day that a violation is permitted to exist shall constitute a separate offense.

SECTION vi.

All rights and remedies of the City of Sanctuary are expressly saved as to any and all violations of the provisions
of this ordinance or any other ordinances affecting fire codes which have accrued at the time of the effective
date of this ordinance, and as such accrued violations and all pending litigation, both civil and criminal,
whether pending in court or not, under such ordinances, same shall not be affected by this ordinance but may
be prosecuted until final disposition by the court.

SECTION ViL.

The City Secretary of the City of Sanctuary is hereby directed to publish caption, penalty clause, and effective
date clause in the official newspaper at least once within ten (10) days after the passage of this ordinance.

SECTION Vili.

This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and publication as provided by law,
and it is so ordained.

DULY PASSED AND APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SANCTUARY, TEXAS, ON 6 JUNE 2023.

_______W? Mayor
(b/ WW @ B City Secretary




Exhibit "A"
2021 International Fire Code

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2021 International Fire Code (IFC) are
hereby amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IFC. Underlined type is text inserted.
Lined through type is deleted text from IFC. A double asterisk (**) at the beginning of a section
identifies an amendment carried over from the 2018 edition of the code and a triple asterisk (***)
identifies a new or revised amendment with the 2021 code.

**Section 102.1; change #3 to read as follows:

3. Existing structures, facilities, and conditions when required in Chapter 11 or in specific
sections of this code. :

**Section 105.6.25; add o read as follows:

105.6.25 Electronic access control systems. Construction permits are required to install or
modify an electronic access control system, as specified in Chapter 10. A separate construction
permit is required for to install or modify a fire alarm system that may be connected to the access
control system. Maintenance performed in accordance with this code is not considered to be a
modification and does not require a permit.

**Section 105.3.3; change to read as follows:

105.3.3 Occupancy Prohibited before Approval. The building or structure shall not be occupied
prior to the fire code official issuing a permit when required and conducting associated

inspections indicating the applicable provisions of this code have been met.

**Section 105.7; add Section 105.7.26 to read as follows:

105. 7 .26 Electronic access control systems. Construction permits are required for the
installation or modification of an electronic access control system. as specified in Chapter 10. A
separate construction permit is required for the installation or modification of a fire alarm system
that may be connected to the access control system. Maintenance perform ed in accordance with
this code is not considered a modification and does not require a permit.



**%Section 107.3; delete this section in ifs entirety:

107.3 Permit valuations. The applicant for a permit shall provide an estimated permit value at
the time of application. Permit valuations shall include the total value of work, including
materials and labor, for which the permit is being issued, such as electrical, gas, mechanical,
plumbing equipment and permanent systems. If, in the opinion of the fire code official, the
valuation is underestimated on the application, the permit shall be denied unless the applicant
can show detailed estimates to meet the approval of the fire code official. Final permit valuatlon

shall be set by the fire code official.
**Section 202; amend and add definitions to read as follows:

** [B] AMBULATORY CARE FACILITY. Buildings or portions thereof used to provide
medical, surgical, psychiatric, nursing, or similar care on a less than 24-hour basis to persons
who ate rendered incapable of self-preservation by the services provided or staff has accepted

respon51b1hty for care recrprents already mcapable This group may mclude but not be 11m1ted to
the following:

- Dialysis centers

Procedures involving sedation

- Sedatlon dentrstry

- Surgerv centers

- Colonic centers

- .Psy‘c.'hiatriccenters

** [B] ATRIUM An opemng connectmg 1we three or more stories.. {remaznzng text unchanged}

*k [B] DEFEND IN PLACE. A method of emergency response that engages building
components and trained staff- to prov1de occupant safety during an emergency Emergency
response involves remaining in place ‘relocating within the building, or both, w1thout evacuatmg

the building.

**FIRE WATCH A temporary measure mtended to ensure contmuous and systematrc
surveillance of a buﬂdmg or portion thereof by one or more quahﬁed 1nd1v1duals or.standb
personnel when required bV the fire code official, for the purposes of identify ing: and. controlhng
fire hazards detectmg early signs of unwanted fire, raising an alarm of fire and notrfymg the ﬁre

department




307 2 Permlt Required. A permit shall be obtained from the fire code official in accordance with
' recognized srlv1cultural or range or wﬂdhfe man ement

pra ices. ,preventron or control of. d1sease or pests or of ;
approval shall’ only be presented by ‘and permits 1ssued to the owner of the Iand upon wh ch'the

fire is to be kindled.

Examples of state or local law, or re; ulations. referenced elsewhere in this section ma mclude but
not be limited to the following: ot

1 Texas Comrmssmn on. Env1ronmentalQ° TCEO) Euldelmes and/or restnctlons

2 State Countv Or Local temporary or D anent'bans on open ‘burning.
3. Local wntten policies as estabhshed by. the fire: code off cial.

*#Section 307.3; change to read as follows:

order the. extm ’ulshment b. the : errmt holder another Herson res ons1ble or the ﬁre de artment
of‘open burmng that creates or adds to a hazardous or obtectronable s1tuatron

**Section 307.4; change to read as follows:

307.4 Location. The location for open burning shall not be less than 56 300 feet (45—249 91 440
‘mif) from any structure, and provisions shall be made to prevent the fire from spreadlng to w1th1n
59 300 feet (45—249 91 440 mm) of any structure - :

307. 4.1 Bonfires. A bonfire shall not be conducted within 50 feet (15 240 mm), or greater drstance
as determined by the fire code official, of a structure or combustible material, unless the fire is

contained in'a barbecue pit. Conditions that could cause a fire to spread within the requrred setback
50 feet (15 240 mm) ofa structure shall be elumnated pI'lOI’ to 1gn1t10n : :

**Sectton 307 4.3, Excepttons, add exceptzon #2 fo read as follows

Exceptions:

2. Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an approved automatic sprinkler sy stem.



HIGH-PILED COMBUSTIBLE STORAGE: add a second paragraph to read as follows:

An bulldm classified as a group S Occupancy or Speculative Building exceeding 6 000 sq.
that has a clear hei ht in excess of 14 feet, making it possible to be used for storage in excess of
12 feet, shall be considered to be high-piled storage. When a specific product cannot be

identified, a fire protection system and life safety features shall be installed as for Class IV

commodmes= to the maximum pile height.

HIGH-RISE BUILDING. A building with an occupied floor located more than 75 55 feet (22
860 16 764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehlcle access.

**REPAIR GARAGE. A building, structure or portion thereof used for servicing or repairing

motor vehlcles This occupancy shall also include garages involved in minor repair, modification

and servicing of motor vehicles for items such as lube ¢hanges. inspections, windshield fe air or

replacement, shocks, minor part replacement, and other such minor repairs.

**SELF-SERVICE STORAGE FACILITY. Real property designed and used for the purpose
of rentmg or leasing individual storage spaces to customers for the purpose of stormg and
removing personal property on a self-service basis.

**STANDBY PERSONNEL. Qualified fire service personnel. approved by the Fire Chief or Fire
Marshal When utlhzed the number required shall be as dlrected by the Fire C}uef Char,czes for
utilization shall be as norinally calculated by the lunsdlc’uon _

**UPGRADED OR REPLACED FIRE ALARM SYSTEM. A fire alarm system that is
up; ’raded or 1e Iaced mcludes" but is not limited to Vthe followm :

Re lacing ehe single 'board or fire alarm control unit component with a newer model
Installmg a new fire alarm control umt in addltlon to or in place of an ex1st1n,q one

Conveljsmn from a horn system to an emergency voice/alarm communication system
Conversion from a convéntional system to one that utilizes addressable or analog dev1ces

o o o o-'?

The followmg are not con51dered an up,qrade or reDlacement
Fumware ubdates : S

& “Except on: {No change.}



**Section 308.1.6.3; change to read as follows:

308.1.6.3 Sky Lanterns. A person shall not release or cause to be released an-untethered unmanned

free-floating device containing an open flame or other heat source, such as but not hrmted to a sky

lantern.

**Section 311.5; change to read as follows:

311.5 Placards. Any The fire code official is authorized to require marking of any vacant or

abandoned buildings or structures determined to be unsafe pursuant to Section 110 of this code
relating to structural or interior hazards, shall-be-marked as required by Section 311.5.1 through

311.5.5.

**Section 403.5; change Section 403.5 to read as follows:

403.5 Group E Occupancies. An approved fire safety and evacuation plan in accordance With
Section 404 shall be prepared and maintained for Group E occupancies and for bulldmgs

containing both a Group E occupancy and an atrium. A diagram deplctmg two evacuation routes
shall be posted in a conspicuous location in each classroom. Group E occupanc1es shall also

comply Wlth Sectlons 403.5.1 through 403.5.3.

**Section 4 04.2.2; add N umb'e‘r 4.10 to read as follows:

4.10 Fire extinguishing sys'tem controls.

**Sectzon 405 4; change Sectzon 405 4 to read as Jollows:

405 5 Tlme The ﬁre code ofﬁ01al may require an evacuation drill at any time. Dnlls shall be held
at unexpected times and under varying conditions to simulate the unusual conditions that dceur in

case of fire.

Exceptions:

1. {No change.}

2.{No change b : '

3. Notification of teachers/staff having supervision of light- or sound-sensitive students/occupants
such as’ those on the aitism - spectrum for the protectlon of those students/occupants shall be

allowed prlor to 3f : :_uotmg a drlll

**Sectlon 5 01 4 change to read as follows

"stallatlon When fire apparatus access roads or @ water supply for fire
'ed to be mstalled for any structure or develonment thev shall be ir _l_e_i

501. 4 Tlmmg of ;
protect1on 1s r




**Section 307.4.4 and 5; add section 307.4.4 **Section 307.4.4 and 307.4.5; change to read as
JSollows:

307.4.4 Permanent Outdoor Firepit. Permanently installed outdoor firepits for recreational fire
purposes shall not be installed within 10 feet of a structure or combustible material.

Exception: Permanently installed outdoor fireplaces constructed in accordance with the
International Residential Code or International Building Code.

307.4.5 Trench Burns. Trench burns shall be conducted in air curtain trenches and i in accordance
with Section 307.2. '

**Section 307.5; change to read as follows:

307.5 Attendance. Open burning, trench burns, bonfires, recreational fires, and use of portable
outdoor fireplaces shall be constantly attended until the... {Remainder of section unchanged)

308.1.4 Open-flame Cooking Dev1ces Charcoal burners and other open—ﬂame cookmg devices,
charcoal grills and other similar dev1ees used for cookmg shall not be operated located or used on
combustible balconies, decks, or within 10 feet (3048 mm) of combustible construction.

Exceptions:

1. One- and two- farmly dwellmgs where LP-gas contamers are limited to a water capac1ty not

greater than 50 pounds (22.68 kg) [nominal 20- pound (9 08 kg) LP- -gas capamty] with an aggregate
LP-gas capac1ty not to exceed 100 pounds (6] contalners) All LP-gas containers shall be stored

outside, as per Chapter 61.

2. Where bulldmgs balcomes and decks are protected by an approved automatzc sprmkler system
and LP- -gas containers are lumted to a water capacity not greater than 50 pounds (22 68 kg)
[nominal 20-pound (9.08 kg) LP- -gas capac1ty] with an aggregate LP-gas capacity not to exceed
40 Ibs. (2 containers). All LP-gas containers shall be stored outside, as per Chapter 61.

3. LP-gas cooking devices having LP-gas container with a water capacity not greater. than 2-172
pounds [nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capac1ty]

**Sectz_o_n 308.1. 6.2, Exceptzon #3; change to read as follows:
Exceptions:

3. Torches or ﬂame—producing devices in accordance with Section 308-4 308. 1.3.



(2) Signs — Signs shall read “NO PARKING FIRE LANE” or "FIRE LANE NO PARKING”

and shall be 12” wide and 18” high. Signs: shall be painted on a white background with letters

and borders in red, using not less than 27 letterlng

Signs shall be permanently affixed to a statronary post and the bottom of the sign shall be six

feet, six inches (6°6) above finished grade. Signs shall be s aced not more than fifty feet
0°) apart along both sides of the fire lane. Signs may be installed on permanent buildings or
walls or as approved by the Fire Chief or Fire Marshal.

**Section 503.4; change to read as follows:

503.4 Obstruction of Fire Apparatus Access Roads. Fire apparatus access roads shall not be
obstructed in any manner, including the parking of vehicles. The minimum widths and clearances
established in Section 503.2.1 and 503.2.2 and any area marked as a fire lane as described in

Sectron 503 3 shall be mamtamed at all times.
**Sectzon 505.1; change to read as follows

505 1 Address Identification. New and existing buildings shall be provrded with approved
address identification. The address identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is
visible from the street or road fronting the property. Address identification characters shall contrast
with their background. Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers
shall not be spelled out, Eaeh character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) 6 inches (152.4
mm) high with a minimum stroke width of 1/2 irich (12.7. mm) Where required by the fir¢ code
official, address numbers shall be provided i inadditional approved locations to facilitate ' emergency
response. Where access is by means of'a private road, buildings do not mlmedrately front a street,
and/or the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign with
approved 6 inch (152.4 mm) height building numerals or addresses and 4 inch (101.6 mm) helght
surte/apartment numerals of a color contrasting: with ‘the ‘background -of the building ‘or other
approved means shall be used to identify the structure. Numerals or addresses shall be posted on a
minimum 20-inch (508 mm) by 30 inch (762 mm) background on border Address 1dent1ﬁcatron

shall be mamtamed

Exceptlon R—3 Smgle Farmly occupaneres shall have approved numerals of a mlmmum 3 )

from the street frontrng the property and tear alleyway where such alleyway emsts

**Sectlon 507 4 change to read as follows

507 4 Water Supply Test Date and Informatlon The water supply test used for hydrauhc

“Recommended Prac‘uce for Flre Flow Testmg and Markrng of Hydrants and thhrn one year of



**Section 5 03.1.1; add sentence to read as follows:

Except for one- or two-family dwellings, the path of measurement shall be along a minimum of

ten feet (10°) wide unobstructed pathway around the external walls of the structure.

**Section 503.2.1; change to read as follows:

’503.2.1 Dimvensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less than

20-24 feet (6696—smm 7315 mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in
accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13-feet-6

inches-(4115-mm) 14 feet (4267 mm).

Exception: Vertical clearance may be reduced; provided such reduction does not impair access by

fire appatatus and aggroved signs are installed and maintained indicating the estabhshed vertical

clearance when apnroved

**Section 5 03.-2.2; clzange ta read as follows:

503.2.2 Authority. The fire code official shall have the authority to require an increase in the
minimum access widths and vertical clearances where they -are inadequate for fire or rescue

operatlons

**Section 503.2.3; change Section 503.2.3 to read anolloWS'

503.2.3 Surface Fire apparatus access roads shall be designed and mamtalned to support 1mposed
loads of. 85.000 Lbs. for fire apparatus and shall be surfaced so as to prov1de all-weather driving
capabilities. .

**Section 503.3; change to read as follows:

503 3 Markmg 8 e
o Stnpmg srgns oF, other

markm rs then ap) roved bs the fire code of icial shall be provrded for fire apparatus access roads‘
to 1dent1fy such roads or prohrbrt the obstruction thereof.

designated Strrpmg, signs and other markings shall be mamtamed ina clean‘ and leglble condmonu

at all times and be replaced or repaired when necessary to provide adequate visibility.

A1), Strlpmg Fire apparatus access roads shall be continuously marked by. painted lines of red
trafﬁc pamt srx mches ( 6”) in. Wrdth to show the boundanes of the Iane The words “NO

. a curb is. avallable’ the stnmn,ar shall be on the vertrcal face of the curb, -




605.4.2.2 Quantity limits. One or more fuel oil storage tanks containing Class II or III combustible
liquid shall be permitted in a building. The aggregate capacity of all tanks shall not exceed the

following:

1. 660 gallons (2498 L) in unsprinklered buildings, where stored in a tank complying with UL 80,
UL 142 or UL 2085, and also listed as a double-wall/secondary containment tank for Class I

liquids.

2. 1,320 gallons (4996 L) in buildings equipped with an aufomatic sprinkler system in accordance
with Section 903.3.1.1, where stored in a tank complying with UL 142 or UL 2085. The tank shall
be listed as a secondary containment tank, and the secondary containment shall be momtored

visually or automatically.

3._3,000 gallons (11 356 L) in buildings equipped with an aufomatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, where stored in protected above-ground tanks complying with
UL 2085 and -Section 5704.2.9.7. The tank shall be listed as a secondary containment tank, as
required by UL 2085, and the secondary containment shall be monitored visually or automatically

**Sectzon 807 5.2 2 and 807 5.2.3; change to read as follows

4807 5. 2 2 Artwork m Corndors Artwork and teachmg matenals shall be l1m1ted on the walls of
comdors to not more than 20 percent of the wall area..Such materials shall not be contintous from
ﬂoor to_ceiling or wall to wall. Curtains, draj eries, wall hangings and othier decorative material
suspended from the walls or ceilings shall meet the flame propagation ; erformance .cr1ter1a of

NF PA 701 in accordance wn:h Sectron 807 or be noncombustlble S
‘Exception: _Cotridors rotected‘ by an approved automatic sprinkler s stem 1nstalled in

; accordance with Sectlon 903 3 1.1 shall ‘be limited to 50 ' ercent of the wall area. ‘

807.5.2.3 Artwork i in Classrooms Artwork and teachmg materials shall be lnmted on walls of
classrooms to not more’ ‘than 50 percent of the specific wall area to which they are attached.
Curtains, draperies, wall hangings and other.decorative material sus ended from the walls or

e111ngs shall meéet the ﬂame propaganon performance cntema of NFPA 701 m accordance wrth

Sectron 807 or be noncombus‘uble

**Sectton 807 5.5. 2 and 807 5.5, 3 change to read as follows

807.5.5.2 Artwork in Corridors. Artwork and teachmg materials shall be l1m1ted on the walls of
comdors to not: more than 20 percent of the wall area.. Such matenals shall not be contmuous from

ﬁﬁlPA 701p1n accordance W1th Sectlon 807 or. be noncombustlble




sprinkler plan submittal. The fire code official shall be notified prior to the water supply test. Water
supply tests shall be witnessed by the fire code oﬁ‘ cial, as required or approved documentation of
the test shall be provided to the fire code official prior to final approval of the water supply system.

The exact location of the static/residual hydrant and the flow hydrant shall be indicated on the
design drawings. All fire protection plan submittals shall be accompanied by a hard copy of the
waterflow test report, or as approved by the fire code official. The report must indicate the
dommant water tank level at the time of the test and the maximum and minimum operating levels
of the tank, as well, or identify applicable water supply fluctuation. The licensed contractor must
then design the fire protection system based on this fluctuation information, as per the applicable
referenced NFPA standard. Reference Section 903.3.5 for additional design requirements.

**Section 507.5.4; change to read as follows:

507.5.4 Obstruction. Unobstructed access to fire hydrants shall be maintained at all times. Posts,
fences, vehicles, growth, trash, storage and other materials or objects shall not be placed or kept
near fire hydrants, fire department inlet connections or fire protection system control valves in a
manner that would prevent such equipment or fire hydrants from being immediately discernible.
The fire department shall not be deterred or hindered from gaining immediate access to fire
protection equipment or fire hydrants.

**Sectton 509.1.2; ada' new Sectton 509.1.2 to read as follows:

509. 1 2 Si n. Re' ‘ulrements Unless _more. strm ‘ent re ulrements apply. 1etter1n,q for signs
requrred bV thrs sectron shall have a minimum herght of2 mches (50.8 mm) when Iocated 1n31de a
burldmg and 4 mches ( 101 6 mm) when located outside, or’ as. amoroved by the fire code oﬁ” cial.
The letters shallvbe of a color that contrasts w1th the. back, ound

* **Sectton 605 4 through 605 4.2.2; change to read as follows

605.4 Fuel oil storage systems Fuel 011 storage systems for building heatlng systems shall be
installed and maintained in accordance with this code. Tanks and fuel-oil Ppiping systems shall be
installed in accordance with Chapter 13 of the International Mechanical Code and Chapter 57

605.4. 1 Fuel 011 storage in outsrde above-ground tanks Where connected to a fuel 011 prpmg
system, the maximum amount of fuel oil storage allowed outside above ground without additional
protection shall be 660 gallons (2498 L). The storage of fuel oil above ground in quantities
exceeding 660 gallons (2498 L) shall comply with NFPA 31 and Chapter 57.

605.4.1.1 Approval. Outdoor fuel oil storage tanks shall be in accordance with UL 142 or UL 2085,
and also hsted as double wall/secondary containment tanks

605 4 2_, Fuel 011 storage m_slde, buildings. Fuel 011 storage msrde bulldmgs shall C M _
TR 40 2 hrough 605.4.2.8 or: and Chapter.57..
pp _}oval Indoor fuel orlstora ‘e tanks shall be in’ accordance Wlth UL 80, UL 142 or

UL 2085



A Addltlonally, records of the testing shall be maintained by the owner and contractor, if

applicable; as required by the State Rules mentloned above and NFPA 25.

8. Standpipe system tests where water will be ﬂowed external to the building shall not be
conducted during freezing conditions or during the day priot to expected night time freezing

conditions.

9. Contact the fire code official for requests to remove existing fire hose from Class II and III
tandprpe systems where employees are not tramed in the utilization of this ﬁreﬁghtmg
equipment. _All standpipe hose valves must remain in"place and be provided ‘with an
am)roved cap and cham When approval is erven to remove hose by the f ire code ofﬁczal

**Sectton 901.6.4; add Sectlon 901.6.4 to read as follows

901 6.4 False Alarms and Nulsance Alarms. False alarms and nuisance alarms shall not be given,

1gna1ed or transrnitted or caused or permrtted to be grven, s1gnaled or transmitted in any manner

**Section 901. 75 cha'nge to read as follows:

-,901 7 Systems Out of Service. Where a required fire protection system is out of service or in the
event of an excessive number of activations, the fire department and the fire code official shall be
- notified immediately and, where required by the fire code official, the building shall either be
evacuated or an approved fire watch shall be prov1ded for all. occupants left unprotected by the
shut down’ untll the f re protecz‘zon sysz‘em has been returned to servrce .. {Remaining text
"unchanged} : S : : ST

**Sectzon 903 I 1 change to read as follows

‘903 1 1 Alternatlve Protectmn Alternatrve automatlc ﬁre extmgulshmg systems complymg Wlth
Section 904 shall be permitted instead of in addltlon to automatic sprinkler protectlon where
recogmzed by the apphcable standard aﬁd or as approved by the f Ire code ofj‘ czal

**Sectzon 903 2 add paragraph to read as follows and delete the exceptlon

Automatrc S nnklers shall not be mstalled in elevator machme rooms elevatorl machme spagces

A( HINERY NO STORAGE ALLOWED B

***Sectzon 903 2 4 2; change to read as follows

a-’ F.-l ﬁre area used for the manufacture of dlStllled spmts mvolvmg more than 120 gallons
of d1, 111ed spmts >16%. alcohol) in the ﬁre area at. any one time.

***Sectzon 903 2.9.3; change to read as follows



Exception: Corridors protected by an approved automatic sprinkler. system mstalled in

accordance with Sectlon 903.3.1.1 shall be limited to 50 percent of the wall area.

807.5.5.3 Artwork in Classrooms. Artwork and teaching materials shall be limited on walls of
classrooms to not more than 50 percent of the specific wall area to which they are attached.
Curtains, draperies, wall hangings and other decorative material suspended from the walls or

erlmgs shall meet the flame propagation performance criteria of NFPA 701 in accordance with

Section 807 or be noncombustrble

**%Section 901.6.1; add Section 901.6.1.1 to read as follows

901 6. 1 1 Standplge Testmg Building owners/managers must_maintain and test standpipe

systems as per NFPA 25 requirements. The following additional requ1rements shall be applied to

the testing that is requlred every 5 years:

L

>

e

IEJ‘

N

. standmne T

The piping between the Flre Department Connectlon DC) and the standpipe shall be
backﬂushed ot inspected by approved camera when foreign materlal is present or when ¢aps
are missing, and also hydrostatically tested for all FDC’s on any type of standnme svstem
HVdrostat1c testmg shall also be conducted in accordance with NFPA 25 requirements for
the different types of standmne systems.

For any manual ( drv or wet) standnrpe system not havmg an automatic. water supply- canable
of flowing water throu oh the standpipe, the tester shall connect hose_.from a fire by drant ‘or
portable pumnm,q svstem ( as approved by. the ﬁre code: ofﬁczal) to éach FDC and ﬂow water

, throth the standmne svstem to. the roof outlet 1o venfv that each inlet connectron functrons

nﬁnn that there: are no onen hose valves prior to- 1ntroducm2 water mto a drv
here 1s no requlred nressure crrtena at the outlet Verlfv that check valves
functron nronerlv and that there are 1o closed control valves on the svstem Lty

Anv pressure rehef reducm,q, Or. control valves shall be. tested in accordance wrth the

egulrements of NFPA 25 All hose valves shall be exercrsed

Ifthe F DC is not alreadv nrovrded Wrth annroved caps, the contractor shall mstall such cans

for-all: FDC s as requlred bv the £ ire code ofﬁczal

Unon successful comnlehon of. standnme test olace a blue tag:(as per Texas Admrnrstratrve
Code Fire. Snrmkler Rules for Insnectlon Test and Maintenance Servroe (ITM) Tag) at the
bottom of each standmne riser in the burldlng The tag shall be check—marked as “Flfch Year”
for Type of ITM and the note on’ the back of the ta shall read 45 Year Stand pipe Test?: at'a
rmmrnum

The Drocedures reqmred bv Texas Admmrstratlve Code F ire Snrmkler Rules Wrth re,qard to

. __requlred notrﬁcatron of the. local Authontv Havrng Junsdrctron ( fire. code 07‘7‘p czal) shall be

followed



**Section 903.3.1.1.1; change to read as follows:

**Section 903.3.1.1.1; change to read as follows

903.3.1.1.1 Exempt Locations. When approved by the fire code off101al automatic sprinklers shail
not be required in the following rooms or areas where such ... {text unchanged}... because it is

damp, of fire-resistance-rated construction or contains electrical equipment.
1. Any room where the application of water, or flame and water. constitutes a serious life or fire

hazard.

2. Any room or space where sprinklers are considered undesirable because of the nature of the
contents, where approved by the fire code ofﬁcial.

3. Generator and transformer rooms, under the direct control of a Dubhc utility, separated from the
remamder of the bmldm by walls .and floor/ceiling or roof/cellm ' assembhes havm‘ a fire-
resistance rating of not Jess than 2 hours

4. Rooms or areas thatare of noncombustible construction with whollv noncombustible contents.

5. Fire service access Elevator machine rooms, and machmerv spaces. and h01stwavs other than
pits where such sprmklers would not neces51tate shunt tm) requlrements under any cucumstances

6. {Delete.}

***Section 903.3.1.2.3; delete section and replace as follows:

[F] Sectlon 9033 1. 2 3 Attached Garages and Attics. Sprinkler protection. is ;re'qtiii_red";#in
attached garages, and in the following attic spaces: - o e

1. Attics that are used or mtended for hvm,q ournoses or storage shall be Drotected by an

automatlc sprinkler ; Sy tem : :
Where fuel- -fired equipment is mstalled‘ in an unsprinklered attlc not fewer than one

ulck—res ponse kmtermedlate tem"erature s rinkler shall be 1nstalled above the

_Attic's aces of bmldm‘ s that are two or more_storles in het ht above rade plane or
above the lowest level of fire department vehlole access. 2

4 3 L Construet the athc usin,q noncombustlble materlals : -
: .44, .. Construct the attic_ using ﬁre-reta:rdant—treated wood comolvm,q w1th
Sectlon 2303 2 of the Intemat1onal Bu11d1n2 Code ‘ : '




- 903.2.9.3 Group S-1 distilled spirits or wine. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout a Group S-1 fire area used for the bulk storage of distilled spirits or wine involving
more than 120 gallons of distilled spirits or wine (>l 6% alcohol) in the fire area at any one time.

**Sectlon 903 2.9; add Section 903.2.9.3 to read as follows

903.2.9.3 Self-Service Storage Facility. An automatrc sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout all self—serv1ce storage facrhtles :

Section 903..2.1 1; change 903.2.11.3 and add 903.2.11.7, 903.2.11.8, and 903.2.11.9 as follows:

903, 2 11 3 Bulldmgs 55 35 feet or more in helght An automatic sprmkler system shall be installed

thro1 out buﬂdm s that have one or more stories with an ‘oceu ant load of 30 or more, other than

Mhouses in comphance with Section 1510 of the International Building Code. located 55 35 feet

16 764 10 668 mm) or more above the lowest klevel of fire department vehicle access, measured to
the ﬁmshed ﬂoor s : .

Exceptions:

1. Open parking structures in compliance with Section 406.5 of the International Building
Code, having no other occupancies above the sub]ect garage

903 2 11.9 Bulldm ..s Over 6 000 sq. ft. An automatrc smmkler svstem shall be mstalled throu,qhout

all bulldul s with a building area 6'1000 sq. ft. or grea
to-be 6.000 sq. ft. or Qreater For the purpose of this Drovrs1on ﬁre walls shall not deﬁne separate

buﬂdrngs

"Excontlon Onen parkm,q '.ara es in com hance wrth Sectron_406.5_of‘ they[nternanonal

exceed 3 stones d. An approved fire aooaratus access road is nrov1ded around the entlre structure



903.3.1.4.2 Heat trace/insulation. Heat trace/insulation shall only be allowed where
approved by the fire code official for small sectrons of large d1ameter Water—ﬁlled pipe.

*%Section 903.3.5; add a second paragraph to read as follows:

Water supply as required for such systems shall be provided in conformance with the supply

reqmrements of the respective standards; however, every water-based fire protection system shall
be desnzked with a 10 psi safety factor. Reference Section 507.4 for additional design

requirements.

**Seétion 903.4; add a second paragraph after the exceptions to read as follows:

Sprmkler and standpipe system water-flow detectors shall be prov1ded for each floor tap to the
prmkler system and shall cause an alarm upon detection of water flow for more than 45 seconds.

All- eontrol Valves in. the sprinkler and standpipe svstems excent for fire department hose

connectlon Valves shall be electneally superv1sed to 1n1t1ate a superv1sog s1gnal} at the central
5 tatron upon tarnpermg : _ ' o '

**Sectzon 903.4. 2 add second paragraph to read as follows

The alarm device required on- the exterlor of the building shall be a Weatherproof hom/strob

n‘ot'ﬁca‘uon am)hance with a muumum 75 candela strobe rating, installed as close ‘as Dractmable
to the ﬁre department connection.

**Sectton 905 2; change to read as follows

905: 2 Installatlon Standard Standpipe systems shall be installed in accordance with thrs section
and NFPA 14, "Manual*d 'y standpipe systems shall be su erv1sed with a minimum of 10 'fs1‘ and

a maxrmum of 40 ps1g air pressure w1th a lngh/low alarm

***Sectzon 905 3 add Sectzon 905 3.9 and exceptzon to read as follows

honzontallv from. the nearest Domt of ﬁre department vehlcle access Class

I automat1c wet or manual wet standp1pes shall be prov1ded

Excegtlons ' T N : S
1. Automatlc drv semi-automatic dry, and manual drv standmnes are allowed as Drov1ded

for i in NFPA 14 where am)roved by the ﬁre code ofﬁc1al
2. R—2 occunanmes of four stones or: less m he1ght havmg no 1ntenor comdors o




4.5. Fill the attic with noncombustible insulation

903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Aufomatic sprinkler systems in Group R
occupancies shall be Dermrtted to be installed throughout in accordance with NEPA 13R where
the Group R occupancy meets all of the following conditions:

1. Four stories or less above grade plane.

2. The ﬂoor level of the thhCSt story is 30 35 feet (9144 10668 mm) or less above the
lowest level of fire deDartment vehicle access.

3. The floor level of the lowest story is 30 35 feet (9144 10668 mm) or less below the
lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

{No change to remainder of section '}

903 3.1.2.2 Corrndors and balconies in the means of egress. Sbrmkler Drotectron s]hall be
provided in all corrldors and for all balcomes in the means of egress where any of the foll lowing

conditions aDDlV {Delete the resz‘ of rhzs section. }

**Section 903.3.1.3 ; change to read as follows“

903 3.1.3 NFPA. 13D Sprlnkler Systems. Auz‘omatzc sprinkler systems mstalled in one- and two-
family dwellings; Group R-3; Group R-4, Condition 1; and townhouses shall be permrtted to be
installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D or in accordance with state law.

**Section 903.3.1.4; add to read as follows:

[F] 903.3.1.4 Freeze‘ »rotectlon Freeze protection systems for automatic fire s, rmkler S stems

s stems shall be ‘allowed 10 ’rrotect attrc S ‘aces

Exceptlon ,Wet-mpe ﬁre snrmkler svstems qhal] be allowed to Drotect non-
ventﬂated attlc snaces Where ~ : ' SR

The attic s‘ nnklers are su lied by a se varate floor control valve assembl

to allow ease of Mdramm’ the attrc s stem w1thout lm’ 'arrﬁn &) nnklers

vthrou' "hout’the rest of the burldm . and o ' S

2. '.Adequate heat shall be Drovrded for freeze nrotectlon as Der the applicable
referenced NFPA standard and

3. The. attic snace isa nart of the burldma ‘s thermal, or heat, envelone such

that 1nsu1at10n is provided at the roof. deck, rather than at the cg_g level.

1.




**Section 907.1; add Section 907.1.4 and 907.1.4.1 to read as follows:

907.1.4 Design Standards. Where a new fire alarm system is installed, the devices shall be

addressable. Fire alarm systems utlllzmg more than 20 smoke detectors shall have analog initiating

devices.
**Section 907.2.1; change to read as follows:

907.2.1 Group A. A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group A occupancies where-the having an

occupant load due-te-the-assembly-oeccupaney—is of 300 or more persons, or where the Group-A

occupant load is more than 100 persons above or below the lowest level of exit discharge. Group
A occupancies not separated from one another in ‘accordance with Section 707.3.-10 of the
International Building Code shall be considered as a single occupancy for the purposes of applying
this section. Portions of Group E oceupancies occupied for assembly purposes shall be prov1ded
with a fire alarm system as required for the Group E occupancy.

Exceptmn {No change.}

Act1vat1on of ﬁre alarm notlﬁca’uon apphances shall:
1. Cause illimination of the meas: of egress w1th L ht of not less than 1 foot-

at the walklng surface level, and ‘_

2. Stop any conflicting or confusing sounds and visual distractions.

candle (11 lux

**Section 907.2.3; change to read as follows

907.2.3 Group E. A manual ﬁre alarm system that initiates the occupant notification signal
utilizing an emergency' voice/alarm communication systei meeting the requirements of Section
907 5 2.2 and mstalled in accordance w1th Sectlon 907 6 shall be 1nstalled in Group E educa’uonal

orie 'bulldm ‘ for alarm occu f'ant load cons1derat1on and mterconnectlon of alarm sf‘: stems e

Exceptlons
-{No change.} - RN ’ ‘
- 1.1.Residential In-Home dav care’ w1th not more than 12 children mav use ,
mterconnected single station detectors i in all habitable rooms. (For care. of more
than five children 2 1/2 ¢ or less years of age. see Sect1on 907 2 6 ) {No change to |

remalnder of exceptlons }




**Section 905.4, change Item 1, 3, and 5, and add Item 7 to read as follows:

1. In 'every required interier-exit stairway, a hose connection shall be provided for each story
above and below grade plane. Hose connections shall be located at an intermediate landing
between stories, unless otherwise approved by the fire code official.

2. {No change.}

3. In every exit passageway, at the entrance from the exit passageway to other areds of a
building.

Exception: Where floor areas adjacent to an exit passageway are reachable from an interies
exit stairway hose connection by a {remainder of text unchanged}

4. {No change.}

5. Where the roof has a slope less than four units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33. 3-percent
slope), each standpipe shall be provided with a two-way a-hose connection shaltbe located
to serve the roof or at the highest landing of an interior exit stairway with stair access to
the roof provided in accordance with Section 1011.12.

6. {No chang_‘e.}

7. When required by this Chapter, standpipe connectlons shall be Dlaced adlacent to all
requlred exits to the structure and at two hundred feet ( 200 ) mtervals along ma1 or comdors
thereafter or as otherw1se am)roved bv the ﬁre code ofﬁ01a1 ’ ~

**Section 905.9; add a second paragraph after the exceptzons to read as follows

S ‘rmkler and stand i pe s stem water ﬂow detectors shall be rov1ded for each ﬂoor ta to the
shall cause an. alarm upon detect1on of water ﬂow for more than 45 seconds

All control valves_ in ‘the sonnkler and standnme svstems éxcept for fire. department ‘hose
conn ctlon valves shall ‘be. electncallv sunerv1sed 10 1mt1ate a suoerv1sorv s1gna1 at the central

tatlon upon tampermg'

**?'Section 905‘ 8; chan,qe fo read as follO‘WS'

905 8 Drv standg pes Dry standplpes shall not be mstalled

Exceptlon Where subj ect to ﬁeezmg and in accordance w1th NFPA 14, Addltlonally, manual dry
standpipe Systems shall be supervised with a minimum of 10 psig and a maximum of 40 psig air

pressure with a high/low Supervisory alarm.



1. Eguipment, control wiring, power wiring and ductwork shall be located exterior to the
bu11dmg and directly connected to the smokeproof enclosure or connected to the
smokeproof enclosure by ductwork enclosed by not less than' 2-hour fire barriers

constructed in accordance with Section 707 of the Bu11__d1ng, Code or horizontal

assemblies constructed in accordance with Section 711 of the Building Code. or both.

2. Equipment. control wirin and ductwork shall be located within the

smokeproof enclosure with intake or exhaust directly from and to the outside or through
ductwork enclosed by not less than 2-hour barriers constructed in accordance with

Section 707 of the Building Code or horizontal asserablies constructed in accordance
with Section 711 of the Building Code. or both.

3. Equipment, control wiring, power wiring and ductwork shall be located within the
~‘bu11d1ng if separated from the remainder of the building mcludm;z other mechanical
gurpment, by not less than 2-hour fire barriers constructed i in accordance with Section
707 _of the Bulldm,q Code or horizontal assembhes constructed n accordance with
Section «: 711 ~of the . Building - . Code, o1 both.

Exceptions:
1. Control .wiring and power wiring utilizing a 2-‘hour rated cable or cable system.,

2. Where encased w1th not less than 2 inches (51 mm) of concrete.

R

3 Control wiring and power wiring nrotected bv a hsted electrlcal circuit nrotectlve
svstems w1th a ﬁre-res1stance rating of not less than 2 hours: ' »

909.21.1.2 Standb, Power Mechanica] vestibule and stairwa and ram| shaft ventilation systems
and automatlc fire ‘detection systems shall be provided with standby power in accordance ‘with

Sectlon 2702 of the Bulldmg Code

1

909 22. 1 3 Acce tance and Testm Before the mecharucal e ‘ ui men1 is
shall be tested in the presence of the fire code official to conﬁrm that th

comnhance w1th these requlrements

**Sectzon 91 0 2 rchange Exceptzon 2 and 3 to read as follows

2 Only manual smoke and heat removal shall 'ﬁet be requlred in areas of buﬂdmgs equlpped
with early suppression fast-response (ESFR) sprinklers. Automatic _smoke and. heat

.removal is Drohlb1ted

3. Only manual smoke and heat removal shall net be requlred in areas of bulldmgs eqmpped

o owith control mode special apphcatlon spnnklers with a response time mdex of 50(m*S)2
..Of less that are listed to control a fire in stored commodltles w1th 12 or fewer spnnklers

Automatlc smoke and heat removal is nrohlblted Ch RN




**Section 907.2.12, Exception 3; change to read as follows:

2. Open air portions of buildings with an occupancy in Group A-5 in accordance with Section
303.1 of the International Building Code; however, this exception does not apply to accessory

uses including but not limited to sky boxes, restaurants, and similarly enclosed areas.

**Section 907.4.2; add Section 907.4.2.7 to read as follows:

90'7.4.2.7 Type. Manual alarm initiating devices shall be an approved double action type.

**Section 907.6.1; add Section 907.6.1.1 to read as follows:

907.6.1.1 Wiring Installation. All fire alarm systems shall be installed in such a manner that a

failure of any srngle 1n1t1at1ng device or single open in an mrtratlng circuit conductor will not

1nterfere with the normal o eration of other such devices. All signaling line circuits SLC
be installed in such a way thata srngle open will not interfere with the operatlon of any addressabl
dev1ces (Class A) Outgoing and return SL.C conductors shall be installed in accordance with
NEFPA 72 requirements for Class A circuits and shall have a minimum of four feet. separation
horizontal and one foot yertical. between sunnlv and return circuit conductors The initiating
device circuit (IDC) from a smnahngr line circuit interface dev1ce may be wired Class B, provided
the distance from the interface device to the initiating device is ten feet or less.

**Section 907.6.3; delete'a_l:ly feur Exeeptions.

**Section 907.6.6; — add sentence at end of paragraph to read as follows
See 907 6. 3 for the requlred mformatlon transm1tted to the supervising statlon

909, 22 Stalrwav or Ramp Pressunzatlon Alternative. Where the burldmg 18 : egurpp ed
throu,qhout Wlth an automatic snrmkler system in accordance with Section 903.3. 1.1 and the stair
nressurlzatlon alternatrve is chosen for com‘ohance wﬁh Bulldmg Code requlrements for a
smoke sroof enclosure, mtenor exit stairways or ramps shall bé ; ressunzed to a minimum of 0. 10
inches of water (25 Pa) and a maximum of 0. 35 inches of water (87 Pa) in the shaft relatlve to the
building measured with all interior exit stairway and ram doors closed under maximum
ant1c1nated conditions of stack effect and wind effect. Such systems shall comnlv w1th Sectlon
909 1nc1ud1ng the installation of a senarate fire-fighter’s smoke control panel as per Section
909 16 and a Srnoke Control Perrmt shall be required from the fire denartment as per Sectlon

1057

909 22 1.1 Ventllatlon Svstems Smokenroof enclosure ventllatlon svstems shall be mdenendent

shall comnlv W1th one of the followmg




Exception: Listed gravity-operated drop out vents.

**Section 910.4.3.1; change to read as follows:

910.4.3.1 Makeup Air. Makeup air openings shall be provided within 6 feet (1829 mm) of the
floor level. Operation of makeup air openings shall be manual-er automatic. The minimum gross
area of makeup air inlets shall be 8 square feet per 1,000 cubic feet per minute (0.74 m2 per 0.4719
m3/s) of smoke exhaust.

**Section 912.2; add Section 912.2.3 fo read as folloWs:

912.2.3 Hydrant Distance. An approved fire hvdrant shall be located within 100 feet of the fire
deoartrnent connection as the fire hose lays alon,cz an unobstructed path.

**Section 913.2.1; add second paragraph and exception to read as follows:

When located on the ground level at an exterior wall, the ﬁre pump room shall be prov1ded with

an extenor ﬁre department access door that is not less than 3ft.in width and 6 fi.—8in 1n helght,

regardless of any interior doors that are provided. A key box shall be provided at this door, as
required by Section 506.1.

Exception: When it is necessary to locate the ﬁre pump room on other levels or not at an
~ exterior wall the,comdorleadm 10 the ﬁre ump room access from the extenor of the buildin
E ‘shall be provided with equwalent ﬁre résistance .as that required. for the 1 pump room f.as

”.apnroved bv the 7" ire. code off czal Access kevs shall be prov1ded in the kev box as. requtred

- "bv Sectlon 506 L

**Section 914.3.1.2; change to read as folIows:

914.3.1.2 Water Supply to required Fire Pumps. In butldmgs that are more than 420 120 feet
(37 m) in buzldzng height, required fire pumps shall be supplied by connections to no fewer than
two water mains located in different streets. Separate supply piping shall be prov1ded between
each connection to the water main and the pumps. Each connection and the supply piping’ between
the connection and the pumps shall be sized to supply the flow and pressure required for'the | pumps

to operate

Exception: {No change to exception.}

**Section 1006.2.2.7; AddSéction ;1'006.2.2.17» as follOWS: o

1006 2. 2 7 Electncal Rooms Xor electrlcal rooms speo1al ex1tm2 requlrements mav applv
Reference the electncal code as adopted o




**Section 910.2; add subsections 910.2.3 with exceptions to read as follows:

910.2.3 Group H. Buildings and portions thereof used as a Group H occupancy as_follows:

1. In occunanmes classified as Group H-2 or H-3, any of which are more than 15.000 square

feet (1394 m?) in smgle floor area.
Exception: Bujldings of noncombustible construction containing only noncombustible

materials.

2. Inareas of buildings in Group H used for stonng Class 2, 3. and 4 liquid and solid oxidizers,

Class L and unclass1ﬁed detonable organic nerox1des Class 3 and 4 unstable (reactive)
matenals or Class 2 or 3 water-reactive materials as required for a hi h—hazard commodi

clas51ﬁcat10n

Exception: Buildings of noncombustible construction containing only noncombustible

materials.

**Section 910.4.3.1; change to read as follows:

910 4.3.1 Makeup Air. Makeup air opemngs shall be provided within 6 feet (1829 mm) of the
floor level Operatlon of makeup air openings shall be manual or autoratic. The minimum gross
area of akeup ‘dir inléts shall be 8 square feet per 1,000 cubic feet per minute (0.74 m2 per 0.4719
m3/s) of smoke exhaust. ,

*Section 91 03, atid,sedcﬁon 910.3.4 to read as Sfollows:
910. 3 4 Vent Operation. Smoke and heat vents shall be capable of being. operated bv am)roved

automatlc and mianual 1 means. Automatlc operation of smoke and heat vents shall conform to the
brov1s1ons of Seetlons 910.3.2.1 thxou,qh 910 3.2.3. Lot SR

910.3.4.1 Sprlnklered buildings. Where installed in buildings equmped wn;h an am:)roved
automatic sprinkler system, smoke and heat vents shall be desig ed to operate automa‘ucall\,

The automatic opetating mechanism of the smoke and heat _vents shall operate at a temperature
ratmg at least 100. degrees E( aDDrox1matelv 38 deszrees Celsius) greater than the temperature rating

f the sprmklers mstalled

ExceD’tiOn Manual oan svstems per Sec‘uon 910 2.

910 3 4 2 Nonsprmklered Bulldmgs Where mstalled in bulldmgs not equipped wﬂ:h an approved
autoniatic s "rlnkler system, smoke and heat vents shall o berate automahcallf by actuation of a
heat—responswe dev1ce rated at between 100°F ( 56°C) and 220°F { 122°C) above amblent




by the fire code official.

**Section 1103.5; add Section 1103.5.5 to read as follows:

1103.5.5 Spray Booths and Rooms. Existing spray booths and spray rooms shall be protected by
an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system in accordance with Section 2404

1103.7.7 Fire Alarm System Design Standards. Where an existing fire alarm system is upgraded
or replaced, the devices shall be addressable. Fire alarm systems utilizing more ‘than 20 smoke
and/or heatidete'ctors'shall have analog initiating devices.

Exception: Existing systems need not comply unless the total building, or fire alarm system
remodel or ex ansioneXceeds 30% of the building. When cumulative bulldm or fire alarm

system, _remodel or ‘eXpansion initiated after the date of original fire alarm anel installation
exceeds 50% of the, building, or fire alarm system, the fire alarm svstem must comblv thhm

. 18 months of perrmt apphcatron

1103 7 7. 1 Commumcatlon requirements. Refer to Section 907.6.6 for applicable

***Sectton 1203; change and add to read as follows

1203.1.1 {No change
1203. 1 2 {No change b

1203 13 Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall be 1nsta11ed in accordance
with the International Buzldzng Code, NFPA 70, NFPA 110 and NFPA 1115 Ex1st1ng 1nstallat10ns
shall be mamtalned in accordance w1th the ori 1na1 ‘a ) roval exce ot as s 'eCIﬁed in Cha ‘,ter 11.

1203 1. 4 hrough 1203 1 9 {No changes 10 these sectlons }

1203 1 10 Crltlcal ()Deratlons Power Svstems ( COPS) For Crltlcal Oneratlons Power Svstems

1203.2 Where Requlred Emergency and standby power systems shall be provrded where
requlred by Sections 1203 2.1 through 1203.2 ~}‘826 ‘or. elsewhere 1dent1ﬁed in th1s code or @any

other referenced code

1203 2.1 through 1203 2. 3 {No change o

1203.2. 4 Emergency Voice/alarm Commumcatlons Systems Ernergency power shall be
prov1ded for emergency vowe/alarm communications systems in the followm ,Noccu‘ 'anc1es oras .




**Section 1009.8; add the following Exception 7:

Exceptions:

Exceptions:
1. through 6. {No change.}

7. Buildings regulated under State Law and built in accordance with State registered plans,
including variances or waivers granted by the State, shall be deemed to be in compliance
with the requirements of Section 1009 and Chapter 11.

**Section 1010.1.9.5 Bolt Locks; amend exceptiOns 3 and 4 as follows:

Exceptions:

3. Where a pair of doors serves an occupant load of less than 50 persons in a Group B,F, M orS
occupancy. (Remainder unchanged)

4. Where a pair of doors serves a Group A, B, F, M or S occupancy (remainder unchange‘d)

**Section 1020.1 Constructmn, add exceptlon 6 to read as follows:

6. In sroup B occupancies, corridor walls and_ ceilings need notvbe of ﬁre-re81stlve construction
w1th1n_a single tenant space when the space is equipped with approved automatic smoke—detecuon
w1th1n the comdor The actuation of any detector must actlvate self—annunmatlng alarms audlble
in all areas W1th1n the corridor. Smoke detectors must be connected to an. apnroved automatlc ﬁre
alarm system where such system is Drov1ded

**Section 1029.1.1.1 Spaces under grandstands and bleachers; delete this section.
**Section’ 1 031 2; change‘to read asfo‘lIOWS'

1031.2 Rellablllty Required exzt accesses, exits and exit dzscharges shall be " contmuously
mamtamed free from obstructlons or- nnpedlments to full mstant use in the | case of fire or other
emergency whe S by-the-rmean egre pied. An exif or éxit

passagewayvshall not be used for any purpose that mterferes with a means of egress

**Section 1103.3; add sentence to end of paragraph as follows:

Provide emergency signage as required by Section 606.3.

*+*Section 1103.5.1: add sentence to read as'-'follovi:{s:?‘ »‘

Fire sprinkier system installation shall be completed within 24 months from daté of notification



1203.2.21 Smokeproof Enclosures and Stair Pressurization Alternative. Standby power shall
be orov1ded for: smokeoroof enclosures. stair nressunzanon alternative and associated automatic
fire detectlon systems as requlred by the Inrernaz‘zonal Buzla’zn},r Code. Section 909.20. 6 2.

1203.2.22 Elevator Pressurization. Standby power shall be prov1ded for elevator pressunzatlo

system as required by the International Building Code, Section 909.21.5.

1203.2.23 Elimination of Smoke Dampers in Shaft Penetrations. Standby power shall be
rovided when eliminating the smoke dampers in ducts penetrating shafts in accordance with the

[nternatzonal Building Code, Section 717.5.3. exception 2.3.

1203 2.24 Common Exhaust Systems for Clothes Dgers Standby power shall be provided for

common exhaust systems for clothes drvers located in multistory structures in accordance with the
Internatzonal Mechanzcal Code, Section 504.10, Ttem 7.

1203 2. 25 Hydrogen Cutoff Rooms -Standby Dower shall be provided for mechanical ventilation
and gag detechon systems of HVdrogen Cutoff Rooms in accordance with the Internatzonal

'Buzldzng Code Sectron 421

1203 2 26 Means of Egress Illummatmn in Exxstmor Buildings. Emergency power shall be
‘rov ed. for means of e ess 1llum1na‘uon in accordance with Sectlon 1104.5 when required b

the: ﬁrejcode ofﬁc1a1 (90 mmutes 1n 1-2.:60 minutes elsewhere :

1203 :3.through 1203.6 |

1203. 7 Energv Tlme Duratlon Unless a time limit i 1s soemﬁed by the fire. code ofﬁmal in this
chapter or elsewhere in this code, or in any- other referenced code or standard, the emergerncy and
standby power s.".stem, shall be supplied with. enou h fuel Or ener stora e ca a01 for not less

than ;Z-hour full demando‘"eratlon,of the system.

Excentlon Where the svstem is sunnhed with natural gas from a u‘uhtv orov1der and is
pproved ‘

**Sectzon 2304 1 change to read as follows

2304 1 Superv1s1on of Dlspensmg The dlspensmg of fuel at motor fuel d1spens1ng facrhtles shall

bo in accordance w1th See&en%%@ét—?»— the followrng

1 "Corrducred by a‘guahﬁed‘attendant; and/or,
2, Shall be under the supervision of a qualified attendant: and/or

3. Shall be an upattended self-service facility in.acCOrdance with Section 2304.3.




specified elsewhere in this code, as required in Section 907.5.2.2.5. The system shall be capable
of powering the required load for a duration of not less than 24 hours, as required in NFPA 72.
Covered and Open Malls, Section 907.2.19 and 914.2.3
Group A Occupancies, Sections 907.2.1 and 907.5.2.2.4.
Snec1a1 Amusement Buildings, Section 907.2.11
Hi h—rrse Buildin S, Section 907.2.12
Atriums, Section 907.2.13
Deep Underground Buildings, Section 907.2.18

1203.2.5 through 1203.2.13 {No change.}

1203.2.14 Means of Egress Illumination. Emergency power shall be provided for means of
egress illumination in accordance with Sections 1008.3 and 1104.5.1. (90 minutes)

1203 2 15 Membrane Structures Emergency power shall be provided for exit. srgns in temnorarv
tents. and membrane structures in accordance with Sectron 3103.12.6.(90 rmnutes) Standby power
shall be prov1ded for auxrhary inflation systems in permanent membrane structures in accordance
with Section 2702 of the International Building Code. (4 hours) Auxiliary inflation systems shall
be provided in temporary air-supported and air-inflated ‘membrane structures in accordance with

sectron 31 03 10.4.

1203.2.16 {No change.}

1203.2.17 Smoke Control Systems. Standby power shall be prov1ded for smoke control systems
inthe followmg occunan01es or as specified elsewhere in this code, as required in Section 909.11:

Covered Mall Building, International Building Code. Section 402.7
Atriums, International Building Code, Section 404.7
c Und '_rgr_ound Buildings, ]nternatzonal Buzldzng Code Section 405.8
Grotip I-3, International Building Code., Section 408.4.2
Sta,qes ]ntemaz‘zonal Buzla’mgr Code Sectlon 410.2.5
St e01a1 Amusement Buildings (as ar hcable to Group A’
Sectlon 411.1 ‘ :

Smoke Protected Seating, Sectlon 1029.6.2.
1203'2.18 {N()' change.}

1203 2 19 Covered and Onen Mall Bulldmgs Emergency power_shall be Drotz ided. o
accordance wﬁh Sectlon 907. 2 19 and 914 2.3. T - , ~

s Interhational Building Code

1203 2 20 Alrport Traffic Control Towers A standbv power svstem shall be nrov1ded in almort
¢ control. towers more than 65 ft. in height. Power shall be provided to the followmg
gulp_ment c
1 Pressunzatlon equipment, mechamcal equmment and lighting.
2: Elevator oneratmg equipment,
3 Flre alarm and smoke detect1on systems. .




*%Section 5703.6; add a sentence to read as follows:

An approved method of secondary containment shall be provided for underground tank a_nd plpmg
systems.

5703.6 Piping Systems. Piping systems, and their component parts, for flammable and
combustible liquids shall be in accordance with Sections 5703.6.1 through 5703.6.11. An approved
method of secondary containment shall be provided for underground tank and piping systems.

**Soction 5704.2.11.4; add a sentence to read as follows:

5704.2.11.4 Leak Prevention. Leak prevention for underground tanks shall comply with Sections
5704.2.11.4.1 end-5764211-4:2 through 5704.2.11.4.3. An approved method of secondary

containment shall be provided for underground tank and piping systems.
**Section 5704.2.11.4.2; change to read as follows'

5704.2.11.4.2 Leak Detection. Underground storage tank systems shall be prov1ded w1th an
approved method of leak detection from any component of the system that is designed and 1nstalled
in accordance Wlth NFPA 30 and as snecnﬁed in Sectlon 5704.2.11.4.3. :

**Sectzon 5 704 2 1 1 4 3 add Sectwn 5 704 2.11. 4 3 to read as follows:

5704 2. 11 4. 3 Observatlon Wells Am)roved samnhng tubes of a minimum: 4 mches in drameter
shall. be mstalled 1n the backﬁll matenal of each underground flaminable or combust1ble hquld
'storage tan The tubes shall extend from a Domt 12 1nches below the average grade of :the

:eXcavat1on to 'oun :

egulred.

**Sectzon 5707.4; add paragraph fo read as follows
Moblle fuehn_[ ._s1tes shall ‘be restncted to commercial, mdustrlal overnmental, or manuf chirin
'Where}‘:z’the' parkin .:area;:havm such operations is . rimaril’ intended for em 5103 ee vehicles.
Moblle_ _fuehn .shall be conducted for fleet. fuehn ' or employee vehicles onl-‘ not\the '.enerel
Dubhc Commercra j,s1t S.8 all be restrlcted 10 ofﬁce-tvoe or snmlar occuDancles that are not

nrunarllv 1ntended for use by the Dubhc

**Sectlon 61 03 -2 ] ; add 'Sec’tz‘o‘n 6103 2.1.8 ta 'i'ead as follows:

6103 2.1.8 Jewelry Repair, Dental Labs and Similar Occupancies. Where natural gas. serv1ce
is not available, portable LP-Gas containers are allowed to be used to supply -approved tor
assembhes or smnlar am)hances Such contamers shall not exceed 20-nound




At any trme the qualified attendant of item Number 1 or 2 above is not present, such operatlons
shall be con51dered as an unattended self—servrce facﬂr ‘and shall also comply with Section

**Section 2401.2; delete this section.
**%Soction 3103.3.1; delete this section.

**Table 3-206:.;2; Jootnote h; change text to read as Jollows:

h. Net—requrred—Where storage areas are protected by either early suppression fast response
(ESFR). sprmkler systems or control mode special application sprinklers with a response time
index of 50 (m « s) 1/2 or less that are listed to control a fire in the stored commodities with 12
or fewer sprinklers, installed in accordance with NFPA 13, manual smoke and heat vents or

manually actrvated engineered mechamcal smoke exhaust systems shall be regmred wrthm

these areas.

**£Table 3206.2, footnote Js add footnote J to row tztled ‘Hzgh Hazard’ and ‘Greater than
300 000’ to read as follows: :

] Hrgh hazard hmh-mled storage areas shall not exceed 500, 000 square feet. A 2-hout: ﬁre wall
constructed in accordance with Section 706 of the Internaz‘zonal Building Code shall vbe used

to divide thh-pﬂed storage exceedmg 500,000 square feet in area,

**Se.ction 3310.1; add sentence to ena’ of paragrapk ‘tol read as follows:

When fire apparatus access roads are requlred to be installed for any structure or develonment

they shall be approved pnor to the time at which construction has progressed beyond completron

of the foundation of anv structure.

*%Section 5601.1.3; change to read as follows:

5601 1. 3 Fireworks. The possession, manufacture, storage sale, handling, and use of fireworks
are prohlbrted

Exceptlons'

1. Onlv when approved for’ ﬁreworks d1snlavs storage and handling of ﬁreworks as

allowed in Section 5604 and 5608

ale... (Delete remainder oftext




a. The reduced fire-flow shall be not less than ;680 1,500 gallons per minute.
Appendix I- Fire Protection Systems-Noncompliant Conditions is adopted in its entirety as part of
the 2021 Fire Code.
«xfgnpendix D Fire Apparatus Access Roads amendments}

**'\*Sectio,n Dl 02.1; change to read as follows:

D102.1 ‘Access and loading. Facilities, buildings or portions of buildings hereafter constructed
shall be accessible to fire department apparatus by way of an approved fire apparatus access road
with an asphalt, concrete or other approved driving surface capable of supporting the imposed load
of fire apparatus weighing up to 75,000 85,000 pounds (34 050 38 556 kg).

*Section D103.4; change to read as follows:

D'1Q3‘.4 Déad ends. Dead-end ﬁre apparatus access roads in excess of 150 feet (45 720 mm) shall be pr_o\)ided with
widt'h and turnaround provisions in accordance with Table D103.4. '

**‘_*Sectron D103.4; change to read as follows: .
X Deéad ends. Dead-end fire apparatus accéss roads i in excess of 150 foet (45 720 mm) shall be

proVIded with wudth and turnaround provisions in accordance with Table D103.4.

' TABLED1034 A S
REQUIREMENTS FOR DEAD- WIDTH (feet) TURN,AR’OUNDS‘REQUIRED '
END FIRE APPARATUS R
ESS ROADS LENGTH
i o ’ o 2024 _ None requrred G i
151—500 o - 2024 ' - 120-foot Hammerhead 60-foot
‘ “Y” or 96-foot. dlameter cul-de-
sac in accordance with Figure
_ .D103.1- -
501-750 26 120-foot Hammerhead, 60-foot
2 S . o . : - "Y"or 96-foot diameter cul-de-
sacin’ accordance wnth Flgure
' ‘ D103 1 :
Over750 ; ‘ “Special approval reqwred »

D103.5 Fire apparatus access road gates. Gates secunng the fire apparatus access roads shall comply
wnth all of the followmg cntena .

1. “Where a‘ ngle gateis provnded the gate wxdth shall be not less than 20 24 feét (6096 73152

g fir apparatus road consrsts of a dlvnded roadway, the gate W|dth shall be not Iess
“than’ 12 foe (3658 mm). : :

=*Section D103.6; change to read as follows:



._Each device

shall be separated from other containers by a distance of not less than 20 feet.
**Section 61 04.2, Excehﬁ'on s add an exception 2 to read as follows:
Exceptions:
1. ({existing text unchanged)

2. Except as permitted in Sections 308 and 6104.3.2, LP-gas containers are not permitted
in residential areas.

**Section 6104.3; add Section 6104.3.3 to read as folloWs:

6104.3. 3 Spas, Pool Heaters, and Other Listed Devxces Where natural. g”as. service is not -
available, an LP-gas container:is allowed to be tised to supply spa. and pool heaters ot other listed

devrcesk Such contamer shall not exceed 25 0 Qallon water ca‘pacrtv per lot See Table 6104 3 for

Excentmn Lots where LP -gas’can be off loaded wholly on. the Dronertv Wher the: tank 1is
l@eated mav mstall up to. 500 gallon above ,qround or .1,000. gallon under,qround am)roved

**Sectton 61 074 and 61 09 13, change to read os follows:

6107.4 Protectmg Containers from Vehicles. Where exposed to vehicular damage due to
proxrrmty ‘te alleys dmveways or parkmg arcas, LP-gas contairiers, regulators and p1p1ng shall be

. {A i l'ca:ble fo those ]urzsdzctzons adoptmg Appendzx B}
T able B105.2; change footnote a. to read as follows:



D103.6 Signs. Marking. Striping, signs, or other markings, when approved by the fire code official, shall
be provided for fire apparatus access roads to identify such roads or prohibit the obstruction thereof.
Striping, signs and other markings shall be maintained in a clean and legible condition at all times and be
replaced or repaired when necessary to provide adequate VISIbIlI’[y

(1) Striping — Fire apparatus access roads shall be continuously marked by painted lines of red traffic
paint six inches (6") in width to show the boundaries of the lane. The words “NO PARKING FIRE LANE”
or "FIRE LANE NO PARKING” shall appear in four inch (4”) white letters at 25 feet intervals on the red
border markings along both sides of the fire lanes. Where a curb is available, the striping shall be on the

vertical face of the curb.

(2) Signs — Signs shall read "NO PARKING FIRE LANE” or "FIRE LANE NO PARKING" and shall be 12
wide and 18” high (See Figure D103.6). Signs shall have red letters on a white reflective background,
usmg not less than 2" lettering. Signs shall be permanently affixed to a stationary post and the bottom of
the sign shall be six feet, six inches (6'6”) above finished grade. Signs shall be spaced not more than fifty
feet (50°) apart along both sides of the fire lane. Signs may be installed on permanent buildings or walls or

as approved by the Fire Chief.

* **Sectlon D104.3; change to read as follows:
D104.3 Remoteness ‘Where two fire apparatus access roads are required, they shall be placed a distance apart equal'
to not less than one half of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dlmensmn of the lot or area to be served,

measured in a stralght line between accesses, or as approved by the fire code official.

***Section D105. 3' change to read as follows:

D105 3 Proxnmlty to bulldmg Unless otherwise approved by the f‘ ire code official, one or more of
the requnred access’ routes meeting this condition shall be located not less than 15 feet (4572 mm) and
not greater than 30 feet (9144 mr) from the bundmg, and shall be positioned parallel to one entire side of
the building. The side of the building on which the aerial fire apparatus access road is positioned shall be

approved by the fire code off:czal
***Sectlon D1 06 3 change to read as foIIows

D106.3-Remoteness. Where two fire apparatus access roads are required, they shall be placed a
£ -apart: equal to not less than one- half of the length of the maximum overall dlagonal dimension of
the property orareato be served, measured in a straight line between accesses, or as approved bv the

f/re code ofﬂc:al

*Saction D107.2; change to read as follows:



D107.2 Remoteness. Where two fire apparatus access roads are required, they shall be placed a
distance apart equal to not less than one-half of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of
the property or area to be served, measured in a straight line between accesses, or as approved by the

fire code official.




